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Sent by email 

Dear 

FOI-1224/1102 
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

Thank you for your request for information received on 5th December 2024.  We can confirm 
that the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board can provide the following 
information. 

1. Does your ICB currently offer Tier 3 weight management services?

 Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent’s (SSOT) Weight-related Interventions Tailored in Care for 
Health (SWITCH) is a specialised service to support people with managing the many 
contributing factors that can make reaching lifestyle and/or weight goals difficult. This service 
doesn’t currently prescribe. 

Weight-related Interventions Tailored in Care for Health (SWITCH) - Staffordshire and 
Stoke-on-Trent, ICS 

2. How many people are currently receiving Wegovy for adults in line with NICE TA875
from your ICB?

 SSOT ICB does not hold this information it would need to be requested from our main 
providers who support our patients: 

- UHNM: foi@uhnm.nhs.uk
- RWT: rwh-tr.foi@nhs.net
- UHDB: uhdb.foi@nhs.net

3. If your ICB offers Tier 3 weight management services, how many people are on the
waiting list for the Tier 3 weight management services?

 SSOT does not hold this information it would need to be requested from our main providers 
who support our patients: 

- UHNM: see above
- RWT: see above
- UHDB: see above

4. What is the current waiting time for patients between referral to your weight
management services and first appointment?

SSOT ICB does not hold this information it would need to be request from our providers: 

SWITCH, UHNM, UHDB and RWT – details are as above. 

https://staffsstokeics.org.uk/weight-related-interventions-tailored-in-care-for-health-switch/#:~:text=Staffordshire%20and%20Stoke%2Don%2DTrent%27s,and%2For%20weight%20goals%20difficult.
https://staffsstokeics.org.uk/weight-related-interventions-tailored-in-care-for-health-switch/#:~:text=Staffordshire%20and%20Stoke%2Don%2DTrent%27s,and%2For%20weight%20goals%20difficult.
mailto:foi@uhnm.nhs.uk
mailto:rwh-tr.foi@nhs.net
mailto:uhdb.foi@nhs.net
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To request an internal review 

You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent ICB 
FOI team by emailing; staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at 
the top of this letter within 40 working days of the initial response.  

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot make a 
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care 
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.  

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot make a 
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care 
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.  

The ICO can be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire   
SK9 5AF 

www.ico.gov.uk  

Yours sincerely 

Paul Winter 
Associate Director of Corporate Governance 

mailto:staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/

