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Sent by email 
 
 
Dear   
 
FOI FOI-07-048:  
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Thank you for your request dated the 14th July 2022.  We can confirm that Staffordshire and 
Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board do not hold the information that you have requested.  
Please see our responses in blue below / attached: 
 
Can you provide a statistical summary of the resources available to the residents of 
Lichfield and Burntwood (Lichfield District Council area) through their registered GP 
practices? 
 
This data does not appear to be publicly available but of course should be an integral 
part of the management of resources by the CCG hence readily available. 
 
We would like to have data of full time, part time and full-time equivalent employees 
and partners classified by: 

a) Partner GPs 
b) registrars 
c) other GPs 
d) Advanced Nursing practitioners 
e) Nurses by grade 
f) Other medical professionals eg Physiotherapists, pharmacists detailed as 

appropriate) 
g) Non-medical support staff, receptionist, clerical support 

 
(You will have a better understanding of the personnel structure of general practice and 
if you have your own better classification, please provide that). 
 
We would like this broken down by the lowest geographical grouping possible, at least 
to distinguish between Lichfield, Burntwood (city and town areas) and rural areas. 
 
Can you also supply the appropriate numbers of registered patients for the 
geographical groups you identify?  Also, if you have them, the relevant population 
figures you use for planning purposes and any other figures which you believe would 
help in the interpretation of the data requested - for example national or regional 
averages. 
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The Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board do not hold the information 
requested.  Please refer to the NHS digital contracts (click on link below):  
 
Website: General Practice Workforce, 30 April 2022 - NHS Digital 
 
where the latest key facts on national statistics and staff group breakdown at practice level is 
available. However, the practice level would require downloading the raw data and filtering to 
the required practices for those two Primary Care Networks covering Lichfield and Burntwood 
or practices covering wider areas.  
 
The data extract also provides details for total number of patients for the 
practices.  Alternatively, the website provides an interactive dashboard with various interactive 
charts displaying different characteristics of staff and data can be drilled down to practice level. 
 
Practices are independent contractors and can determine locally what workforce information 
they publish on their websites.  The Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board 
utilises data from the above website when undertaking any workforce planning. 
 
National population figures are also published on NHS Digital and a breakdown by practice as 
at the 1st April 2022 is shown below. 
 
Practice Code: Practice Name:    Quarter: Practice  
         List Size: 
 
M83006  The Westgate Practice   04/01/2022 29852 
M83030  The Langton Medical Group   04/01/2022 13737 
M83072  Salters Meadow Health Centre  04/01/2022 11409 
M83617  Darwin Medical Practice   04/01/2022 18599 
Y02414  Burntwood Health and Wellbeing Centre 04/01/2022   4962 
 
Right of Appeal 
 
Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response please do 
not hesitate to contact us.  If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are entitled to request 
an internal review which should be formally requested in writing and must be within two 
calendar months from the date this response was issued. 
 
To request an internal review 
 
You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent 
Integrated Care Board FOI team by emailing the team at 
StaffsStokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at the top of this letter.  
 
If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot make a 
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care 
Board FOI complaints procedure.  
 
The ICO can be contacted at:  
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 

https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/general-and-personal-medical-services/30-april-2022
mailto:StaffsStokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk
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Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF  
 
www.ico.gov.uk   
 
 
Yours sincerely  
 
 
 
Paul Winter 
Deputy Director of Corporate Governance,  
Compliance & Data Protection/Data Protection 
 

http://www.ico.gov.uk/

