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Sent by email 

Dear  

FOI-0124-688 
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

Thank you for your request for information received on the 18th January 2024.  We can 
confirm that the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board can provide 
the following information.   

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB 
website. 

Please see our responses in blue below: 

I am writing to request the following information under the Freedom of 
Information Act: 

1. How many babies were born in your Integrated Care System from 1 April 2021
to 1 April 2023?

A total of 12,762 births reported in the University Hospitals of North Midlands NHS 
Trust K2 data for April 2021 to April 2023 – a total of 25 months. 

A total of 199 births reported in the University Hospitals of Burton and Derby NHS 
Trust for April 2023 only, in Burton – a total of one month’s data. 

2. How many babies do you estimate there are aged 0-2 living in your Integrated
Care System currently?

Please see link below to the ONS Census Data which is publicly available: 

Census - Office for National Statistics (ons.gov.uk) 

3. What proportion of them accessed Start for Life services during the period 1
April 2022 to 1 April 2023?

The ICB do not hold this information.  Please redirect to Stoke-on-Trent City Council 
and Staffordshire County Council as detailed below: 

https://www.ons.gov.uk/census
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Stoke-on-Trent City Council 
https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_req

uests 

Staffordshire County Council 
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-
access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx 

4. The Family Hubs and Start for Life programme guide states that 10% of babies
have a ‘disorganised’ attachment style which is associated with the worst
developmental outcomes. (see Annex I: perinatal mental health and parent–
infant relationship support on p81) What percentage of babies aged 0-2 in your
Integrated Care System are you commissioning specialised parent-infant
relationship services for? i.e. a clinical psychologist or child psychotherapist
led service, as outlined here: https://parentinfantfoundation.org.uk/our-
work/what-is-a-parent-infant-team/

The ICB do not hold this information.  Please redirect to Stoke-on-Trent City Council 
and Staffordshire County Council as detailed below: 

Stoke-on-Trent City Council 
https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_req

uests 

Staffordshire County Council 
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-
access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx 

Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response 
please do not hesitate to contact us.  If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are 
entitled to request an internal review which should be formally requested in writing and 
must be within two calendar months from the date this response was issued. 

To request an internal review 

You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent 
Integrated Care Board FOI team by emailing the team at 
StaffsStokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at the top of this 
letter. 

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly 
to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO 
cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-
Trent Integrated Care Board’s FOI complaints procedure.  

https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_requests
https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_requests
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx
https://parentinfantfoundation.org.uk/our-work/what-is-a-parent-infant-team/
https://parentinfantfoundation.org.uk/our-work/what-is-a-parent-infant-team/
https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_requests
https://www.stoke.gov.uk/info/20032/our_data/153/freedom_of_information_requests
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx
https://www.staffordshire.gov.uk/Your-council-and-democracy/Request-and-access-information/Request-and-access-information.aspx
mailto:StaffsStokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk
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The ICO can be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire   
SK9 5AF 

www.ico.gov.uk  

Yours sincerely 

Paul Winter 
Associate Director of Corporate Governance 

http://www.ico.gov.uk/

