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Our Ref: PW/KJJ/FOI/1224/1129 Stafford Education & Enterprise Park

31t December 2024 Weston Road

Stafford
ST18 OBF
Sent by email
Telephone: 0300 123 1461
Dear

FOI-1224/1129
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

Thank you for your request for information received on 18" December 2024. We can confirm
that the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board can provide the following
information.

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB website.

1. Alist of all Mental Health Support Teams (MHSTS) currently operational within your
ICB.
Stoke-on-Trent 3 teams
Newcastle-under-Lyme 1 team
Stafford Borough 1 team
Cannock Chase 1 team
Lichfield District 1 team
Tamworth Borough 1 team
East Staffs 2 teams
Seisdon 1 team

2. The full addresses for each MHST listed above.
ICB does not hold this information please contact:

Midlands Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust: Freedom of Information ::
Midlands Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust

North Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS Trust:
FOIRequests@combined.nhs.uk

3. Alist of all CAMHS (Child and Adolescent Mental Health Services) teams currently
operational within your ICB.
MHST
CYP Eating Disorder
CYP CAMHS
CYP Intensive Support
CYP Participation services
CYP LAC
CYP Early Years
CYP Paediatric Psychology

Chair: David Pearson MBE Chief Executive Officer: Peter Axon
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4. The full addresses for each CAMHS team listed above.
ICB does not hold this information please contact:

Midlands Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust: Freedom of Information ::
Midlands Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust

North Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS Trust: ts@combined.nhs.uk

To request an internal review

You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent ICB
FOI team by emailing; staffsstokeFOl@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at
the top of this letter within 40 working days of the initial response.

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.

The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

WWW.IC0.gOoV.uk

Yours sincerely

Paul Winter
Associate Director of Corporate Governance

Chair: David Pearson MBE Chief Executive Officer: Peter Axon


https://www.mpft.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-information
https://www.mpft.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-information
mailto:FOIRequests@combined.nhs.uk
mailto:staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/

