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Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

Thank you for your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, received on
the 21st July 2025. We can now confirm that the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care
Board can provide the following information.

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB website.

Commissioning Contacts

1. The name(s) of the person or people responsible for commissioning ADHD assessment
and diagnosis services.
Darren Birks — ADHD
Karen Webb - ASD

2. The name(s) of the person or people responsible for commissioning Autism assessment
and diagnosis services.
As above.

3. The telephone number(s) for the above contacts (ADHD and Autism commissioning).
0300 123 1461

4. The email address(es) for the above contacts (ADHD and Autism commissioning).
MentalHealthPortfolioinbox@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk

If personal details cannot be provided due to GDPR, please supply a team or departmental
contact instead.

Waiting Lists

5. The current size of the ADHD assessment waiting list for adults.

6. The current size of the ADHD titration waiting list for CAMHS.

7. The current size of the Autism assessment waiting list (please specify if this is for adults,
children, or both).
The ICB does not hold this information, we have two commissioned NHS providers for ADHD
and Autism services:
e Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust - foi@mpft.nhs.uk
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¢ North Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS Trust - FOIREquests@combined.nhs.uk

To obtain this information please redirect your request to the Trusts detailed above.

Referral Volumes

8. The average number of ADHD referrals for adults received per month over the past 12
months.

9. The average number of ADHD referrals for CAMHS received per month over the past 12
months.

10. The average number of Autism referrals received per month over the past 12 months.
The ICB does not hold this information, we have two commissioned NHS providers for ADHD
and Autism services:

o Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust - foi@mpft.nhs.uk
e North Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS Trust - FOIREquests@combined.nhs.uk

To obtain this information please redirect your request to the Trusts detailed above.

Private Sector Support
11. Do you currently utilise any private provider support to manage ADHD referrals?
If yes, please provide:
¢ Name of the provider
o Contract start and end date
e Annual contract value (EGBP)
The ICB does not hold an NHS contract with any private provider or right to choose provider for
ADHD and Autism.

12. Do you currently utilise any private sector support to manage Autism referrals?
If yes, please provide:
¢ Name of the provider
e Contract start and end date
e Annual contract value (EGBP)

N/A as the ICB does not hold a contract with any private provider.

Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response please do not
hesitate to contact us. If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are entitled to request an
internal review which should be formally requested in writing and must be within two calendar
months from the date this response was issued.

To request an internal review

You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent ICB
FOI team by emailing; staffsstokeFOl@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at the
top of this letter within 40 working days of the initial response.

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.
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The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

WWW.ic0.gov.uk

Yours sincerely

Tracey Shewan
Director of Corporate Governance

Chair: David Pearson MBE
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