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Our Ref: PW/KJJ/FOI/0125/1160 

12th February 2025 

Sent by email 

Dear 

FOI-0125/1160 
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000  

Thank you for your request for information received on 27th January 2025.  We can confirm 
that the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board can provide the following 
information.   

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB website. 

Please see our responses in blue below: 

Question 1: Does the ICB/ ICS provide Community Dermatology Services? If yes, how 
many for your ICS?  Yes 

Question 2: Please specify the name of the Community Service Providers and the 
address of the clinics? 
Our.Tier.9.Dermatology.service.is.provided.by.HealthHarmonie¡ 

• Dermatology is delivered from the location below:
• Basford Consulting Rooms - 540 Etruria Rd, Basford, Newcastle-under-Lyme, 

Newcastle ST5 0SX
• Dunston Business Village - Stafford Rd, Penkridge, Stafford ST18 9AB
• The Anglesey Clinic - 46 Anglesey St, Hednesford, Cannock WS12 1AA
• Cobridge Community Health Centre - Church Terrace, Cobridge, Stoke-on-Trent 

ST6 2JN 
• Dr Rasib Surgery - Cannock Chase Hospital, Cannock WS11 5XY

Question 3: Are these clinics led by primary or secondary care? 
Neither – Independent Community Service Provider Service  

Question 4: Can you please provide the number of patients treated by each provider 
within the last 12 months? With their average wait time 
Oct 2023 – Nov 2024 - 15,097 patients had an initial appointment with Health Harmonie 

Question 5: Does the Community Dermatology Service provide maintenance treatment 
for patients with any of the following drug types? 

• High cost drugs – that require blueteq approval - N/A
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• Monoclonal antibody drugs (e.g. Adalimumab, Dupilumab, Secukinumab,
Ustekinumab) - Information not held with ICB

• JAK inhibitors (e.g. Abrocitinib, Baricitinib) - Information not held with ICB

Question 6: Does the Community Dermatology Service provide initiation of treatment 
for patients with any of the following drug types? 

• High cost drugs – that require blueteq approval – N/A
• Monoclonal antibody drugs (e.g. Adalimumab, Dupilumab, Secukinumab,

Ustekinumab) - Information not held with ICB
• JAK inhibitors (e.g. Abrocitinib, Baricitinib) - Information not held with ICB

To request an internal review 
You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent 
ICB FOI team by emailing; staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the 
address at the top of this letter within 40 working days of the initial response. 

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly 
to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO 
cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-
Trent Integrated Care Board’s FOI complaints procedure.  

The ICO can be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF 

www.ico.gov.uk  

Yours sincerely 

Paul Winter 
Associate Director of Corporate Governance 
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