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Dear
FOI/0126/1582

Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

Thank you for your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, received
on the 19" January 2026. We can now confirm that Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated
Care Board can provide the following information.

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB website. The
ICBs response is provided below in blue text.

You have requested:

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, | request the following information regarding
neurodivergent (ADHD and autism) assessment services:

1) For each NHS provider currently commissioned to deliver neurodivergent assessment
services in your area, what is the total annual contract value for:

2023/24 - We are unable to break down the block contract expenditure with our NHS
commissioned services with Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust and Noth Staffordshire
Combined Healthcare NHS trust

2024/25 - We are unable to break down the block contract expenditure with our NHS
commissioned services with Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust and Noth Staffordshire
Combined Healthcare NHS trust

2025/26 (to date) - We are unable to break down the block contract expenditure with our NHS
commissioned services with Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust and Noth Staffordshire
Combined Healthcare NHS trust

If block contracts cover multiple services beyond neurodivergent assessments, please
provide the total contract value and indicate what proportion or percentage relates to
neurodivergent assessment services.

We are unable to break down the block contract expenditure with our NHS commissioned
services with Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust and Noth Staffordshire Combined
Healthcare NHS trust
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2) What is the total spending on Right to Choose activity (payments to private/independent
sector providers) for neurodivergent assessments for:

2023/24 - £2,606,750
2024/25 - £2,277,483
2025/26 (to date) - £4,557,981

3) How many neurodivergent assessments were completed by NHS-commissioned
providers for:

2023/24 - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust

2024/25 - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust

2025/26 (to date) - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation
Trust and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust

25/26 (Q3)

No local data No local data No local data

25/26 (Apr - Nov)

1,430 216
No local data (CYP - two NHS providers) (CYP - two NHS providers)

If complete data is not held by the ICB, please provide activity data available from provider
reporting.

4) How many neurodivergent assessments were paid for via Right to Choose providers
for:

2023/24 — We are unable to provide this level of detail

2024/25 - We are unable to provide this level of detall

2025/26 (to date) - We are unable to provide this level of detail

This should be available from invoicing data even if individual patient-level data is not
routinely collected by ICB.

5) What were the average waiting times from referral to assessment for NHS-
commissioned neurodivergent assessments for:

2023/24 - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust

2024/25 - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust
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2025/26 (most recent data) - See table below for combined data for Midlands Partnership NHS
Foundation Trust and Noth Staffordshire Combined Healthcare NHS trust

'25/26 (Q3)

Ranging from 691 to 2,190 days
No local data No local data (adults - two NHS providers)

25/26 (Q3)
70 weeks 54 to 77 weeks
No local data (CYP - two NHS providers) (CYP - two NHS providers)

25/26 (Q3)
895 days
No local data No local data (adults - one NHS provider)

If ICB does not hold this data directly, please provide the most recent waiting time data
reported by commissioned providers.

6) Please provide a complete list of all providers that have invoiced your ICB for
neurodivergent assessment services for:

2023/24 — See table below
2024/25 — See table below
2025/26 (to date) — See table below

23/24 24/25 25/26
ADHD 360 LTD ADHD 360 ADHD 360
Childrens Choice Therapy Axia Axia
Clinical Partners Centre for ADHD Research & Excellenc{CARE
Dr Jawawi Psychiatrists Clinical Partners Clinical Partners
Evolve Psychology Services [Dr) DrJ
Evolve Psychology Services |Evolve Evolve
H & AK Fletcher Harrow Health Harrow Health
Oxford ADHD Latahzan Centre Health Harmonie
Provide Wellbeing Mantle Psychology Held Health
Psicon Mind Holistic ADHD
Psych UK Oxford ADHD & Autism Kirsop-Taylor Healthcare
Stone Pharmacy Provide Wellbeing KT Healthcare
The Psychology Centre Psicon LaTahzan Centre
Psych UK Mantle Psychology
RTN Medical Mind
Skylight Psychiatry Modality
Solutions 4 Health Neurodiversity Assessment Ltd
Teledoctor Oakdale Therapies
Optegra
Paloma Health
Problem Shared
Provide Wellbeing
Psicon
Psych UK
RTN Mental Health Solutions
Seven Care
Skylight Psychiatry
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Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response please do not
hesitate to contact us. If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are entitled to request an
internal review which should be formally requested in writing and must be within two calendar
months from the date this response was issued.

To request an internal review

You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent ICB FOI
team by emailing; staffsstokeFOl@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at the top of
this letter within 40 working days of the initial response.

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a
decision unless you have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care
Board’s FOI complaints procedure.

The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

WWWw.ico.gov.uk

Yours sincerely

Paul Winter
Associate Director of Corporate Governance
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