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4th September 2025 

Sent by email 

Dear  

FOI/0825/1408 
Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

Thank you for your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and thank you 
for your email dated 28th August clarifying the request.  We can now confirm that Staffordshire and 
Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board can provide the following information.   

An anonymised copy of this response will be made publicly available on the ICB website. The ICBs 
response is provided below in blue text. 

You have requested: 

I am writing under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information about the 
Lung Cancer Screening (previously Targeted Lung Health Check) programmes in your ICB. 

1. Do you have a Lung Cancer Screening [LCS] (or formerly Targeted Lung Health Check
[TLHC]) programme running in your ICB region? Yes
a. If Yes, please answer Questions 2 and 3
b. If No, please move to Question 4

2. If your answer to Question 1 is Yes, please answer the following questions for each active
LCS (TLHC) service / contract within the region:
a. Areas covered

LCS is available to the whole eligible population of Staffordshire and Stoke on Trent via patient direct 
access. Eligibility is determined by clinical factors etc set by the national team. This supplements roll 
out invitations of eligible people largely based on area of residence / GP practice. The initial roll out 
is complete for the Stoke-on-Trent, North Staffordshire and the Stafford areas and is underway for 
the remainder of the ICB. Newly eligible patients are enrolled as they become eligible. Eligible 
people who opted not to participate can re-enrol at any time. 

b. Commissioner of the service (i.e. name of the ICB, NHS Trust, Cancer Alliance etc. who is
leading on the programme in the ICB)

West Midlands Cancer Alliance 

c. Name of the provider who delivers the service (e.g. name of the NHS Trust or external
provider)

University Hospital North Midlands. 
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d. Start date and end date of the contract

The ICB doesn’t hold this information it would need to be requested from University Hospital North 
Midlands.

e. Can the contract be extended beyond its end date, and if yes, for how long? N/A
▪ If so, has there been a decision made about the extension? N/A

f. The total value of the contract

The ICB does not hold this information  it would need to be requested from University Hospital North 
Midlands.

g. Actual spend in 2024/25

The ICB does not hold this information  it would need to be requested from University Hospital North 
Midlands.

3. Is the ICB planning on rolling out further Lung Cancer Screening programmes within the
region?
a. If yes, in which areas?

Lung Cancer Screening programme is already being rolled out across our population. 

b. If yes, when is the service expected to start? N/A
c. If yes, is this expected to be delivered in-house or by an external provider? N/A
d. If external provider, when is the procurement expected to start? N/A
4. If your answer to Question 1 is No, is the ICB planning on rolling out any Lung Cancer
Screening programmes in the next 12 months? N/A
a. If yes, in which areas?
b. If yes, when is this expected to start?
c. If yes, is this expected to be delivered in-house or by an external provider?
If external provider, when is the procurement expected to start?

Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response please do not 
hesitate to contact us.  If you are dissatisfied with the response, you are entitled to request an 
internal review which should be formally requested in writing and must be within two calendar 
months from the date this response was issued.  

To request an internal review 
You can request an internal review by contacting the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent ICB FOI team 
by emailing; staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk or by post to the address at the top of this letter 
within 40 working days of the initial response. 

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may apply directly to the Information 
Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you 
have exhausted the Staffordshire and Stoke-on-Trent Integrated Care Board’s FOI complaints 
procedure.  

mailto:staffsstokeFOI@staffsstoke.icb.nhs.uk
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The ICO can be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF 

www.ico.gov.uk  

Yours sincerely  

Paul Winter 
Associate Director of Corporate Governance 

http://www.ico.gov.uk/

