FOI: ICB AACC Finance & Data Reporting

Please consider that you may need to complete more than one response, if you have different providers/models/geographies (e.g., partially in-house, with some elements provided by another provider, or some elements may be done by a local authority, etc).
	Q1
	Name of ICB
	



	Q2
	AACC Service Delivery
	AACC Care Spend

	Please indicate (Y/N) whether the ICB costs include the following
	Y
	Y

	Please indicate whether the ICB includes the service delivery costs within the budget
	Y
	Y

	What were the total care costs for 23/24?
	£7,081,302
	Exempt under Section 21 of FOIA information is available on the ICB website



	Q3
	Discharge to Assess (D2A)
	CHC – 
PD / MH / LD
	Funded Nursing Care
	Fast Track
	Joint Funding
	Appeals
	Retrospective Reviews
	PUPoC
	CYP
	Complex CYP Cases (not eligible for CC)
	CYP Looked after Children
	CoP / DoLS
	Section 21A & Welfare
	Section 117
	LD & Autism TCP
	ABI Slow Rehab

	Please indicate (Y/N) which of the following categories were included in the total ICB AACC care spend costs for 23/24
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	Y
	?
	Y
	N
	Y



	Q4
	Weekly Care Home Beds
	Domiciliary Care
	1:1 Care in Nursing Homes
	1:1 Care for Care in Homes from Domiciliary Providers

	Please indicate (Y/N) whether the ICB has set cost rates for the following
	Y – for new packages
	Y – for new packages
	Y – for new packages
	N

	If yes, please specify the set cost rate
	£1,157.10 (2024/25)
	2024/25
Core CHC £23.03 per hour
EOL/Rural £23.273 per hour
Nurse/TDDI £26.42 per hour

	2024/24 
£21.13 per hour
	N/A



	
Q5
	Per Week for a Nursing Home Bed
	
Per Week for D2A Beds
	Per Hour for 1:1 Enhanced Observation Care
(Nursing Homes)
	Per Hour for 1:1 Enhanced Observation Care (Domiciliary Care)
	Per Hour for Domiciliary Care
(day rate)
	Per Hour for Domiciliary Care (night rate)
	Per Hour for Domiciliary Care (WE/BH rate)

	Please specify the average following costs
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above
	Data not held in the format, except for set rates above



	#
	Question
	Answer

	Q6
	Does the ICB apply any limits to 1:1 care hours?
	Yes, 20 hours per day

	Q7a
	Does the ICB change the care rates paid to care providers if an individual with NHS funding is admitted to hospital?
	Yes

	Q7b
	If yes, by what percentage or by what agreed rate, if different from the base rate?
	* For the Nursing Home contract the full Bed Day cost remains payable for a period of six consecutive weeks following which the bed day cost will reduce by twenty per cent on day 43.
 	 	 	 	 	 	 
* Payment for the Specific additional care e.g. 1:1 will cease on the day of the Service Users admission to hospital
 	 	 	 	 	 	 
* Nothing payable for dom care
 	 	 	 	 	 

 


	Q8
	Does the ICB have an open book approach with Local Authorities regarding Nursing Home and Domiciliary Care rates?
	No

	Q9a
	Does the ICB have jointly agreed rates with the Local Authorities regarding all or any aspects of care rates?
	No

	Q9b
	If yes, what are the rates and which categories do they relate to?
	N/a

	Q10a
	Does the ICB commission and use an AACC data / Case Management System (CMS)?
	Yes

	Q10b
	If yes, what is the name of the system?
	SProc (hosted by Access Adam)

	Q11
	Does the ICB utilise a Data Warehouse for reporting?
	Yes

	Q12a
	Does the ICB commission and use a Dynamic Procurement System (DPS)?
	Yes

	Q12b
	If yes, what is the name of the system?
	SProc DPS (hosted by Access Adam)

	Q13
	Does the DPS link with the data / Case Management System?
	Yes

	Q14a
	Does the Local Authority use a DPS?
	unknown

	Q14b
	If yes, what is the name of the system?
	unknown

	Q15a
	Does the ICB use a digital system for financial reconciliation of care spend and care provider payment and invoices?
	Yes

	Q15b
	If yes, what is the name of the system?
	SProc (hosted by Access Adam)

	Q16a
	How does the ICB audit the AACC care spend?
	External auditors

	Q16b
	How often is this audit undertaken?
	At least twice per year

	Q17
	What is the ICB average clawback per month of unused care spend? (e.g., where hours allocated are not used or delivered.)
	N/A – not paid out if not used

	Q18
	What contract period do you issue with your care providers? (e.g., 1 year etc.) 
	1 year



